1 J

3/25/2010
RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FRESNO ADOPTING
THE 489" AMENDMENT TO THE MASTER FEE SCHEDULE RESOLUTION
NO. 80-420 TO ADD, REVISE, OR DELETE VARIOUS FEES

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FRESNO:

THAT the Master Fee Schedule Resolution No. 80-420 be and is hereby amended to add, revise, or
delete various fees. The revised pages of the Master Fee Schedule are attached as Exhibit “A” and are
hereby incorporated by reference and made a part of this Resolution.

THAT fees shall become effective July 1, 2010 unless otherwise noted on the revised pages of the
Master Fee Schedule.

CLERK'S CERTIFICATION

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF FRESNO )ss.
CITY OF FRESNO )

I, REBECCA E. KLISCH, City Clerk of the City of Fresno, certify that the foregoing Resolution was
adopted by the Council of the City of Fresno, California, at a regular meeting thereof, held on the
_day of , 2010.

AYES:

NOES:

ABSENT:

ABSTAIN:
Mayor Approval: , 2010
Mayor Approval/No Return: , 2010
Mayor Veto: , 2010
Council Override Veto: , 2010

REBECCA E. KLISCH
City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM
CITY ATTORNEY’S OFFICE

BY:
Tei Yukimoto, Sr. Deputy City Attorney

K:\USERS\ELI\MFS\RESOS\489TH ANNUAL RESO.DOC


CindyH
Typewritten Text
1  J

CindyH
Typewritten Text
3/25/2010


CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

AIRPORTS DEPARTMENT

AIRPORT FEES - Airways Golf Course - Green Fees

o % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Weekdays 17.75 18.50 100% 22
after 2 p.m. (PST) 14.00 15.00 100%
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 14.00 15.00 100%
Weekends/Holidays (as identified in FMC 3-166) 20.00 20.75 100% 22
after 2 p.m. (PST) 14.00 15.00 100%
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 14.00 15.00 100%
Tournaments 22.50 23.50 100% 22
Seniors (62 and over --See * below for ID 10.75 11.25 100%
Juniors (18 and under --See * below for ID
requirements) 10.75 11.25 100%
Juniors Golf Team 3.75 4.00 100%
Monthly Cards (restricted to the individual named) 22
Seniors (Unlimited)* 42.50 44.00 100%
Surcharge / per round +3.50 +3.75 100%
Juniors (Unlimited)* 42.50 44.00 100%
Surcharge / per round +3.50 +3.75 100%
Frequent Players (No restriction on time of play) 70.75 73.50 100%
Surcharge, weekdays / per round +5.00
Surcharge weekends/holidays / per round +6.75 +7.00 100%
Fresno Yosemite International Airport
Federal Inspection Station User Fee 23
Per Deplaned passenger using the Federal 15.00 14.00 33.82%
Inspection Station
Landing Fees 23
Signatory Commercial Operations 2.35 2.30 100%
Each 1,000lbs MCGLW 2.35 2.30 100%
Minimum per Landing 24.48 23.96 100%

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 1




CONVENTION CENTER

CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

CONVENTION CENTER

e % of Cost

Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery | MFS Page #
Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports N/A 22,24

Per ticket (or attendee) and n each round of golf 0.75 1.00 34 & 40
* Surcharge-istsunsetoris-up-forrenewal-at the Delete
—end-of FY-2010

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted

Page 2

MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM]




CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery | MFS Page #
Automatic Fire Extinguishing System - 5 Year Test 25

Fire pump test / each 84.00 91.00 100%

Standpipe / each 84.00 91.00 100%

Dry pipe valve trip test / each 84.00 91.00 100%

FFD Connection flush / each 84.00 91.00 100%

Riser / each 84.00 91.00 100%
Consultation - Per Hour 54.00 61.00 100% 25
Dance Permit Application Inspection 84.00 89.00 100% 25
Family Day Care Inspection/Pre-Inspection 84.00 44.00 100% 25
Fire Alarm System 25

Plan Check (one hour min) 134.00 161.00 100%

Special Fire Protection Systems: (includes: CO2, 110.00 111.00 100%

Devices: Includes Strobes, Horns, Panels, Pull
"1 - 10 Devices 110.00 111.00 100%
111 + Devices 110.00 + 4 I?er 111.00 + 4 I?er 100%
Device Device
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 3




FIRE DEPARTMENT

CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Fire Inspections - Initial Inspection 26
Occupancy Type: B,F,M-Factory/Industrial, Retail, Business/Office less than 50 people
1-2,000 sq ft 39.00 44.00 100%
2,001 - 5,000 sq ft 53.00 51.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 58.00 59.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 64.00 68.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 70.00 78.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 77.00 90.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 85.00 104.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 94.00 120.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 103.00 138.00 100%
200,000+ sg-ft 113.00 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: A, E, H, S (Excludes R-1 apartments, hotels/motels), Assembly (Theater,
Churches, Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school), Excessive Hazardous Material
(Welding, Open flame, High Hazard Storage) 26
1-2,000 sq ft (S Only) 39.00 44.00 100%
1-5,000 sq ft 70.00 79.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 77.00 91.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 85.00 105.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 94.00 121.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 103.00 139.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 113.00 160.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 124.00 184.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 136.00 212.00 100%
200,000+ sg-ft 156.00 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: | Hospitals, Nursing homes w/medical care, Prisons, and Mental fac.
1-10,000 sq ft 188.00 229.00 100%
10,001 - 25,000 sq ft 301.00 437.00 100%
25,001 - 40,000 sq ft 415.00 644.00 100%
40,001 - 75,000 sq ft 530.00 852.00 100%
75,001 + sq ft 644.00 1,060.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 4




CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Fire Inspections - 1st Re-Inspection 27
Occupancy Type: B,F,M-Factory/Industrial, Retail, Business/Office less than 50 people
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-2,000 sq ft 61.00 63.00 100%
2,001 - 5,000 sq ft 74.00 72.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 81.00 82.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 89.00 92.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 98.00 103.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 108.00 113.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 119.00 124.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 131.00 134.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 144.00 144.00 100%
200,000+ sqg-ft 158.00 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: A, E, H, S (Excludes R-1 apartments, hotels/motels), Assembly (Theater,
Churches, Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school), Excessive Hazardous Material
(Welding, Open flame, High Hazard Storage) 27
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-2,000 sq ft (S Only) 61.00 63.00 100%
1-5,000 sq ft 84.00 96.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 92.00 106.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 101.00 113.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 111.00 127.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 122.00 137.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 134.00 148.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 147.00 158.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 162.00 169.00 100%
200,000+ sg-ft 178.00 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: | Hospitals, Nursing homes w/medical care, Prisons, and Mental fac. 27
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-10,000 sq ft 202.00 260.00 100%
10,001 - 25,000 sq ft 316.00 468.00 100%
25,001 - 40,000 sq ft 429.00 675.00 100%
40,001 - 75,000 sq ft 513.00 883.00 100%
75,001 + sq ft 658.00 1,091.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 5




CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Fire Inspections - 2nd Re-Inspection 28
Occupancy Type: B,F,M-Factory/Industrial, Retail, Business/Office less than 50 people
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-2,000 sq ft 76.00 72.00 100%
2,001 - 5,000 sq ft 89.00 82.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 98.00 92.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 108.00 103.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 119.00 113.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 131.00 124.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 144.00 134.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 158.00 144.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 174.00 155.00 100%
200,000+ sqg-ft 19100 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: A, E, H, S (Excludes R-1 apartments, hotels/motels), Assembly (Theater,
Churches, Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school), Excessive Hazardous Material
(Welding, Open flame, High Hazard Storage) 28
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-2,000 sq ft (S Only) 76.00 72.00 100%
1-5,000 sq ft 94.00 106.00 100%
5,001 - 10,000 sq ft 103.00 117.00 100%
10,001 - 20,000 sq ft 113.00 127.00 100%
20,001 - 40,000 sq ft 124.00 137.00 100%
40,001 - 80,000 sq ft 136.00 148.00 100%
80,001 - 120,000 sq ft 150.00 158.00 100%
120,001 - 150,000 sq ft 165.00 172.00 100%
150,000 + sq ft 182.00 186.00 100%
200,000+ sg-ft 200-00 Deleted N/A
Occupancy Type: | Hospitals, Nursing homes w/medical care, Prisons, and Mental fac.
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
1-10,000 sq ft 210.00 270.00 100%
10,001 - 25,000 sq ft 323.00 475.00 100%
25,001 - 40,000 sq ft 436.00 682.00 100%
40,001 - 75,000 sq ft 550.00 890.00 100%
75,001 + sq ft 659.00 1,097.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 6




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

. % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Fire Inspections - Initial Inspection 29
Occupancy Type: R-1 (Apartments, Hotels/Motels
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
3 - 9 Units 54.00 56.00 100%
10 - 19 Units 69.00 64.00 100%
20 - 29 Units 84.00 74.00 100%
30 - 49 Units 114.00 85.00 100%
50 - 99 Units 144.00 98.00 100%
100+ Units 150.00 113.00 100%
Fire Inspections - 1st Re-Inspection 29
Occupancy Type: R-1 (Apartments, Hotels/Motels
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
3 - 9 Units 72.00 73.00 100%
10 - 19 Units 87.00 84.00 100%
20 - 29 Units 102.00 94.00 100%
30 - 49 Units 132.00 104.00 100%
50 - 99 Units 163.00 115.00 100%
100+ Units 178.00 125.00 100%
Fire Inspections - 2nd Re-Inspection 29
Occupancy Type: R-1 (Apartments, Hotels/Motels
Reinspection violations all corrected: 0.00 0.00
Reinspection violations not all corrected:
3 - 9 Units 87.00 84.00 100%
10 - 19 Units 102.00 94.00 100%
20 - 29 Units 117.00 104.00 100%
30 - 49 Units 148.00 115.00 100%
50 - 99 Units 178.00 125.00 100%
100+ Units 200.00 136.00 100%
Additional Citation Fees, if non-compliance
30 Days 200.00 100%
60 Days 500.00 100%
90 Days 800.00 100%
High Rise Inspections / Per Structure 2,425.00 2,432.00 100% 29
Fire Investigation Report 303.00 312.00 100% 29
Fire Prevention Counter Fee 15.00 Delete N/A 30
Fire Pumps 30
Pump Acceptance test / each (all types) 209.00 243.00 100%
Electrical inspectors fee / each 77.00 89.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 7




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

. % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Fire Sprinkler Systems 30
Plan Check Per Hour (One Hour Min) 110.00 161.00 100%
1 - 20 Sprinkler Heads 110.00 111.00
110.00 + 1.25} 111.00 + 1.25
21 + Sprinkler Heads / Per Sprinkler] / Per Sprinkler 100%
Pre-Action, Dry, Deluge, or Foam Systems 110.00 124.00 100%
Each Floor Above 3 Stories 110.00 124.00 100%
Monitoring System 110.00 124.00 100%
—Abeve-Ground-Fanks/-each-(all Fypes) 1106001 Moved to Spec Haz Area
Pump Acceptance Test 209.00 243.00
Fireworks: 30
One-time Event / each 138.00 152.00 100%
Sale of Safe and Sane Fireworks (From June
28th to July 6th of the year the permit is issued) / 671.00 626.00 100%
per firework stand
Incorrect address/location given by applicant, failure of 100%
responsible party to appear at pre-scheduled appt/per trip 74.00 81.00
Citation for non-compliance with FMC 10-53302 / Use of 1,000.00
lllegal Fireworks + $250.00 State Fire Marshal Disposal
Fee (TOTAL Citation Fee will be $1,250.00)
Flammable Liquid: Class | N/A 30
10-100-gallens 4100
101-1.000-gallens #7109
2,001 4,000 gallens 93.00 Sgihizmed
499%% 1062:09 Below Under
Combustible Liquid: Class Il Special
25—100-gallens #300] Hazard User
101—1;000-gallens 00l permit Fees
4,001 +gallens 102.00
110.00] Moved to Spec Haz Area 30
OceupancyFire 137.00 Delete N/A 31
Overtime Fire Inspection/per hr (Minimum one Hr) 141.00 155.00 N/A 31
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 8




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

. % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Penalty - Per Trip 31
Incorrect address/location given by applicant, failure of
responsible party to appear at pre-scheduled appt/per trip 74.00 81.00 100%
Premature inspection call (work not ready)/per trip 74.00 81.00 100%
Reinspection other than entitled calls / per trip 74.00 81.00 100%
Working without required permit 4 x standard permit
Posting Placarding on Dangerous Buildings 142.00 138.00 100% 31
Public Safety Alarms - Response to False Alarm 31
One response each fiscal year No Charge
Second response or more each fiscal year/each 148.00 165.00 100%
Special Hazard User Permit Fees N/A 31&32
Aereseol-Produets 56.00
Compressed-gasses:
—201-3,000-eu-ft 7100
—15.001 +¢cu-ft 102.00
Cryegens:
—1-500-gallens 7100
—501-1;000-gallens #7-06] See Revised
—1.001+gallens 85.00] Schedule
—2,001-4,000-gallens 93.09 Below
—4,001+gallens 16260
Explosives 5600
Meodel Rockets(storage){perannum 56.00
Emergency-Response BusinessPlan/per 163.00
Repair-Garages #1060
Fire-Storage 56.00
WoedProduets 7100
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 9




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description

Current

Proposed

% of Cost
Recovery

MFS Page #

Special Hazard User Permit Fees

(Maximum permit fee would not exceed $183

regardless of multiple quantities)

LEVEL 1
10 - 100 gallons of flammable/combustible liquid
20 - 100 Ibs of solid
201 - 3,000 cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 500 - 999 Ibs
High Pile Storage (501 - 2,500 sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

LEVEL 2
101 - 1,000 gallons of flammable/combustible
101 - 1,000 Ibs of solid
3,000 - 6,000 cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 1,000 - 2,400 Ibs
High Pile Storage (2,501 - 12,000 sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

LEVEL 3
1,001 or more gallons flammable/combustible
1,001 Ibs or more of solid
6,001 or more cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 2,500 or more Ibs
High Pile Storage (12,001 or more sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

57.00

74.00

92.00

100%

100%

100%

32

Hazardous Material Incident:

Per Apparatus / Per Hour
Plus other costs of supplies, materials, contract labor,
etc.

211.00

238.00

100%

32

Emergency Response Business Plan / per building

211.00

180.00

100%

33

Open Burning / event

211.00

238.00

100%

33

Suppression Standby

211.00

238.00

100%

33

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM]

Page 10




CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

CITY CLERK'S OFFICE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES SECTION

. % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery | MFS Page #
Fresno Municipal Code per MC 37
Complete Set (without binders)
Picked Up 165.60].05 cents per page
mailed 485.00].05 cents per
page plus
actual cost of
postage
Maintenance
Year 52.60]|Delete
Zoning Ordinance Text per MC 39
Zoning booklet
Picked up 25-00].05 cents per page
Mailed .05 cents per
page plus
actual cost of
35-00]postage
Maintenance-service
Annual 30.00
Building, Plumbing, Electrical, and Mechanical per MC 35
Chapter 13 of the FMC
Picked up 106-606].05 cents per page
Mailed 17.00].05 cents per
page plus
actual cost of
postage
Charter, City of Fresno per MC 35
Picked up 106-606].05 cents per page
Mailed 15.00].05 cents per
page plus
actual cost of
postage
City Council Material per MC 36
Agenda, mailed
Quarter $ 20.00
Year $ 70.00
JaKit_picl
Packet $— 1775 Delete
Quarter $ 2500 Delete
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 11




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

VARIOUS MFS SECTIONS

GENERAL GOVERNMENT

. % of Cost
Fee Description
p Current Proposed . MFS Page #
Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports N/A 34
Per ticket (or attendee) and on each round of golf 0.75 1.00
* Surcharge-istsunsetoris-up-forrenewal-at the Delete
—end-of FY-2010
PERSONNEL SERVICES DEPARTMENT
GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES
. % of Cost
Fee Description
p Current Proposed . MFS Page #
Transcript, Certification of per MC 39
leat : . - . I
Duplication of Civil Service Board recordings
28-45+ Cost-of
—Costof cassettes-and-duplication Tapes Delete
Per tape 44.00
Plus cost of tape(s) Actual Cost] Actual Cost
Subpoenaed Records (rates established by State) per MC 38
—Standard-copy/perpage 650 Delete
Standard copy / per page (including scanned/digital
copies) New 0.10
Copying documents from microfilm / per page 0.50 0.20
Clerical costs associated with retrieval of records and
Hour 20.00 24.00
Quarter hour or fraction thereof 5.00 6.00
DOWNTOWN COMMUNITY AND REVITALIZATION
GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES
o % of Cost
Fee Description
p Current Proposed . MFS Page #
Enterprise Zone Areas - Special Rates N/A 52-54
Various text changes from Exhibit A & B to Text]Change
The official enterprise zone map.
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 12




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PARKS DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND

Fee Description

Current

Proposed

% of Cost
Recovery

MFS Page #

Delete|
Delete|
Delete|

N/A

41

Community & Neighborhood Centers *

—City-spoensered;

Delete|

N/A

41

EOC Neighborhood Center

Gymnasium (per hour/2 hour minimum)
* Gymnasium rates do not apply to EOC Neighborhood
Center.

** | arge organized events are by contract only

New,|

100.00

Add Text
Add Text

42%

41

Playfield
Lighted (per hour / 2 hour minimum)
Standard Time--after 5 pm
Daylight Savings Time--after 8 pm
Additional light circuit by same org at same facility
Hour/2 hour minimum
Unlighted facility (per hr/2 hr minimum)
*Fees apply to organized events.

18.25

6.25
12.00

35.00

25.00

100%

71%

42

GENERAL RECREATION FEES
All Swim Pools
Monthly swim pass (30 days of admission)
Children (ages 6 to 17)
Adults (age 18 and over)
Adult, age 18 and over
Youth, age 6 to 17
Children, age 0 to 5 (accompanied by an adult)

15.00
30.00
2.00
0.75

1.00

18%

43

Community Sports Teams
Adult Sports league Late Fee

New

50.00

90%

44

Regional Sports Complex Entrance Fee
Year around / per vehicle

—Neon-Resident/per-vehicle

3.00

5.00
Delete

market rate

45 & 48

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM]

Page 13




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PARKS DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Regional Sports Complex User Fee 44
Deposit (80% refundable)
1-3 Fields/Day New 500.00
4-6 Fields/Day New 750.00
7-9 Fields/Day New 1000.00
Tournament Play Text
1-3 Fields/Day 100.00 500.00
4-6 Fields/Day 175.00 900.00
7-9 Fields/Day 250.00 1300.00
Recreation Staff / per hour 13.00
Night Play/Field 25.00
Youth Sports Camps & Instructional Leagues N/A 45
BasketbalHnstructional Camp/per-participant 35.00 Delete
Biddy-BasketbalHnstructional- League/per-participant 35.00 Delete
Football,-Seccer-& BasketbalHnstructional League/per 35-00 Delete
Girls/Boys Sports Camp / per participant 50.00
Amphitheaters and Regional Park Group Activity 46
(Eaton Plaza, Woodward, Roeding & Regional Sports
Park Group Activity Areas)
Private or non-City Groups
Group size:
Up to 200 200.00
201 to 500 350.00
Over 500 500.00
Over 1000 New 1,000.00 100%
Local charitable non-profit groups
Group size:
Up to 200 100.00
201 to 500 175.00
Over 500 250.00
Over 1000 New 500.00 100%
. I " |
Group-size:
—Upte-200 —0-
—201t0-500 —0-
—Over-500 —0-
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 14




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PARKS DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery MFS Page #
Cleaning Deposit N/A 46
(Up to 80% refundable dependent on the condition of
the facility after completion of the rental agreement)
Group size:
Up to 200 250.00
201 to 500 500.00
Over 500 1000.00
Over 1000 New, 2,000.00
payment-of gross-event-concessionrevenues-and-a-per
attendee charge. Delete Text
* Additional costs incurred for City services are the
responsibility of the reservation holder. Exp. Solid New Text
\Waste costs for additional trash bins.
Skate and Bike Park Facility Rental 47
Modular Park Rental/per hour (2 hr minimum)
Up to 50 participants allowed New 35.00 100%
Concrete Park Rental/per hour (2 hr minimum)
Up to 100 participants allowed New 50.00 100%
Optional fee: Onsite Instructor/per hour
Multiple instructors available for large groups New 15.00 100%
Security/Cleaning Deposit (per facility)-flat/80% New 100.00 100%
refundable
Roeding Park Entrance Fee** 47
Year round / per motor vehicle 3.00 5.00] market rate
Roeding Park picnic Table Reservation Fee* 47
—Yearround-{pertable: Eull-Day** Half Day-**
—Umbrella-Grove 14.00 8.00
—Eucalyptus-Grove 14.00 8.00
—Cedar Grove 14.00 8.00
—StreetCar-Shelter 18.00 10.00
—Redwood-Grove 4 12.00 +06
Picnic Shelters (full day/ year round/ per table) New 15.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 15




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PARKS DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND

e % of Cost
Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery | MFS Page #
Woodward Park Entrance Fee** 48
Year round / per motor vehicle 3.00 5.00] market rate
—Non-Resident/pervehicler** 5-:00 Delete
Woodward park Picnic Table Reservation Fee * 48
Year round / per table:
Gazebo 10.00 12.00 100%
Picnic shelters 25.00 30.00 100%
BMX/Skate Contest Fees 49
Amateur Contest / per entry New 15.00 100%
Pro Contest / per entry New 30.00 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 16




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

COVENANTS AND SPECIAL AGREEMENTS

. % of Cost
Fee Description rrent Pr
p Curre oposed . MFS Page #
Environmental Assessment Pass thru 50
Fish and Game Filing Fee (for applicable projects) 1,993.00 2,010.25 to the State
Environmental Impact Report (EIR) Pass thru 50
Fish and Game Filing fee for EIR's 2768.25 2,792.25] to the State
CODE ENFORCEMENT
. % of Cost
Fee Description rrent N
i curre ew Recovery | MFS Page #
Lien Release Fee 53
Per lien Release - County Filing Fee 26.00 58.75 100%
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 17




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

POLICE DEPARTMENT

GENERAL FEES

e % of Cost

Fee Description Current Proposed Recovery | MFS Page #
Regional Training Center Facilities Fees 55

Range Office - monthly 450.00

Shared Range Office - monthly 225.00

Classroom - daily 250.00

Classroom - half day 175.00

Mat Room - daily 400.00

Mat Room - half day 250.00

Pistol Range - daily 600.00

Pistol Range - half day 400.00

Rifle Range - daily 700.00

Rifle Range - half day 450.00

Tactical House - daily 500.00

Tactical House - half day 350.00

Range Fee - Daily rate per person
(included in range rental when range is rented) 15.00

Emergency Vehicle Operations Course (EVOC) -
daily 1,300.00

Driver Awareness Pad - daily 400.00

K-9 Field - daily 200.00

Pursuit Car - daily 88.00

PIT Car - daily 75.00

Motorcycle - daily 47.00

Training Officer - Hourly Straight Time 53.90

Training Officer - Hourly Overtime 56.01

Training Sergeant - Hourly Straight Time 63.62

Training Sergeant - Hourly Overtime 67.52
Police Administrative Citation Fees 56

1st citation per violation 1,000.00

2nd citation per violation 10,000.00

3rd citation per violation 50,000.00

Other: Actual Cost

a. Actual administrative costs

b. Enforcement costs

c. Abatement costs

d. Costs incurred by the City associated with

relocation of tenants resulting from enforcement of

this Ordinance (FMC 10-715).

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted

MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 18




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

WASTEWATER RATES

. % of Cost
Fee Description rrent Pr
P Curre oposed | Recovery | MFS Page#
Engineering, Inspection, and Street Work
Television/Sewer 61
—MinimumColor-percall 140.00 Delete N/A
Hauled Waste Disposal 58
Fats, Oil & Grease - per gallon New 0.03
Wastewater Rates N/A 60
High Industrial
Sewage Effluent, metered
Per 1,000 gallons?
Pounds BOD = (W =+
Pounds BOD = (W + 1,000,000) * 8.345 * BOD text| 1,000,000) * 8.345* BOD
concentration in mg/l) concentration in mg/| 60
Note: BOD concentration can
(insert new text for added clarification) New] be based on the actual or
estimated value
Pounds BOD = (W =+
Pounds TSS = (W = 1,000,000) * 8.345 * TSS text| 1,000,000) * 8.345 * BOD
concentration in mg/l) concentration in mg/l
WATER DIVISION
. % of Cost
Fee Description rrent Pr
p Curre oposed . MFS_Page #
Service Connections N/A| N/A| 59
Minimum residential service connections:
Lots less than 20,000 square feet (1-inch) Less than Less than
12,500 squaref 20,000 square
feet feet
Lots 20,000 square feet or greater (1-1/2 inch) 12,500 square] 20,000 square
feet feet
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 19




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

SOLID WASTE
. % of Cost
Fee Description rrent Pr
p Curre oposed . MFS Page #
Roll off and Compactor Service (Single & Multi-Family 17.46 17.15 57
residential)- Recycling Tip fee/ per ton
Roll off and Compactor Service (Single & Multi-Family 22.70 23.15 57
Residential)- Green Waste Recycling Tip fee/ per ton
Roll off and Compactor Service (Single & Multi-Family) 28.12 28.70 57
Per Tip fee per ton - Transfer Station
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 20




CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
AMENDMENT SUMMARY
PUBLIC WORKS

PUBLIC WORKS

Fee Description Current Proposed ;ef,r;ﬁ:'; PRrng/iitE:
Parking Permits 62
Uncovered spaces per month 65.00 70.00] Market Rate
Covered spaces per month 80.00 85.00] Market Rate
Weekday 1/2 day event parking voucher 0.00 3.00] Market Rate 63
0-4 hours, minimum 100 maximum 600
Weekday full day event parking voucher 0.00 5.00] Market Rate
4-8 hours, minimum 100 maximum 600
Special Event Rate 5.00 7.00] Market Rate
* Excludes Grizzlies games
Parking, City of Fresno Employees 62
Second permit (employee with 2nd vehicle) 25.00 Delete N/A
Parking without permit in posted areas 6.00 Delete N/A
Parking Penalties, Disabled or Handicapped 64
Parking in handicapped zone/per violation 300.00 300.00 N/A
rename: Parking in handicapped CROSSHATCH
zone
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201011:58 AM] Page 21




CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

AIRPORT FEES

AIRWAYS GOLF COURSE - GREEN FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd

Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports* (at all City owned facilities 489
that comprise the Fresno Convention & Entertainment Center, and the

Riverside Municipal and Airways Golf Courses. The Arts, Park,

Entertainment and Sports (APES) ticket surcharge fee is to be

applied to all tickets sold for attendance to all event types and on

each round of golf, irrespective of the ticket selling party,

irrespective of ticket price. The City reserves the right to waive the

surcharge upon City Manager approval).

Per ticket (or attendee) and on each round of golf 0.75 1.00
= \Weekdays 17.75 18.50 489
after 2 p.m. (PST) 14.00 15.00
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 14.00 15.00
** \Weekends/Holidays (as identified in FMC 3-116) 20.00 20.75 489
after 2 p.m. (PST) 14.00 15.00
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 14.00 15.00
* Tournaments 22.50 23.50 489
Seniors (62 and over—See * below for ID requirements) 10.75 11.25
Juniors (18 and under—See * below for ID requirements) 10.75 11.25
Junior Golf Team 3.75 4.00
** Monthly Cards (restricted to the individual named) 489
Seniors (Unlimited)* 42.50 44.00
Surcharge / per round +3.50 +3.75
Juniors (Unlimited)* 42.50 44.00
Surcharge / per round +3.50 +3.75
Frequent Players (No restriction on time of play) 70.75 73.50
Surcharge, weekdays / per round +5.00
Surcharge, weekends/holidays / per round +6.75 +7.00

* Tee times will be restricted to weekdays and after 2 p.m. (standard time) or 3 p.m. (daylight savings time)
on weekends and holidays, or based on course availability as determined by lessee. A valid driver's license
or school photo ID, as applicable, is required. Another form of indentification bearing a birth date may be
submitted with prior aproval from the Airways Golf Course General Manager.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:06 PM Page 22



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

AIRPORT FEES

FRESNO YOSEMITE INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Customer Facility Charge 431
Per rental car transaction generated at the FYI Airport 10.00
Contracted Airport Public Safety Services (per hour, two hour 409
minimum)
Airport Public Safety Officer 48.51
Public Safety Vehicle + Officer 49.42
Equipment Rental
Per Day 75.00 464
Energy Supplemental Charge 383

Applicable to appropriate tenants of Fresno Yosemite International Up to 100% of additi-
Airport. A pass through of additional monthly costs of energy via a onal energy increase

percentage surcharge on the energy portion of facility charges percentage per month
Federal Inspection Station User Fee 489
Per deplaned passenger using the Federal Inspection Station 15.00 14.00
Fuel Flowage Fee 464
Fresno Yosemite International Airport (per gallon) 0.10
Gate Use Fee 409
Signatory Commercial Operations / per month 250.00
Non-Signatory Commercial Operations / per use 25.00
Commercial Aviation Permit Operators (CAPO) / per use 25.00
General Aviation International Arrivals Clearance Fee 456
Per inspection 150.00
Keys (provided to tenants) 393
Each key over first 6 issued 5.00
Landing fee 489
Signatory Commercial Operations
Each 1,000 pounds MCGLW* 2.35 2.30
Minimum per landing 24.48 23.96
Non-Signatory Commercial Operations 464
Each 1,000 pounds MCGLW* 2.94
Minimum per landing 30.60
Commercial Aviation Permit Operators (CAPO) 464
0 to 7,000 pounds MCGLW?* / per landing 11.08
7,001 to 12,500 pounds MCGLW* / per landing 14.89
Over 12,500 pounds MCGLW*
Each 1,000 pounds MCGLW* 2.65

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:06 PM Page 23



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

CONVENTION CENTER

CONVENTION CENTER - BASIC RATES*

* Rates and overtime use of the Convetion Center, except as otherwise provided for, shall be at
the discretion of the Director. Rate shall be either: 1) the Basic Rates; 2) 10 percent of gross
receipts; or 3) square footage rate, whichever is greater. Overtime shall be: 1) the rate indetified
as overtime; or 2) applicable rate set forth in Basic or Special Rates for the whole of shortest
period in which overtime occurs.

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd

Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports* (at all City owned facilities 489
that comprise the Fresno Convention & Entertainment Center, the

Riverside Municipal and Airways Golf Courses. The Arts, Park,

Entertainment and Sports (APES) ticket surcharge fee is to be

applied to all tickets sold for attendance to all event types and on

each round of golf, irrespective of the ticket selling party,

irrespective of ticket price. The City reserves the right to waive the

surcharge upon City Manager approval).

Per ticket (or attendee) and on each round of golf 0.75 1.00
Arena, non-commercial daily rate (including holidays and New 393
Year's Eve)

8 a.m. to 12 noon 1,700.00

12 noon to 6 p.m. 1,700.00

6 p.m. to 12 midnight 3,200.00

8a.m.to 6 p.m. 3,000.00

8 a.m. to 12 midnight 4,000.00
Theater, non-commercial daily rate (including holidays and New 393
Year's Eve)

8 a.m. to 12 noon 800

12 noon to 6 p.m. 800

6 p.m. to 12 midnight 1,500.00

8a.m.to 6 p.m. 1,400.00

8 a.m. to 12 midnight 1,600.00
Theater, non-profit daily rate (including holidays and New 393
Year's Eve)

- local, community-based, non-profit cultural arts organization
- activity relevant to the organization's mission/purpose

- derive 90 percent benefit from the activity

- Director retains authority of determining appropriate rate

8 a.m. to 12 noon 650.00
12 noon to 6 p.m. 650.00
6 p.m. to 12 midnight 1,300.00
8a.m.to 6 p.m. 1,200.00
8 a.m. to 12 midnight 1,500.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:14 PM Page 24



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Automatic Fire Extinguishing System -- 5-Year Test 489
Fire pump test / each 84.00 91.00
Standpipe / each 84.00 91.00
Dry pipe valve trip test / each 84.00 91.00
Fire Department connection flush / each 84.00 91.00
Riser / each 84.00 91.00
Building Permit Surcharge Fire Prevention Fee
Triplex / per permit 16%
Apartment / per permit 16%
Hotels/motels / per permit 26%
Commercial / per permit 26%
Industrial / per permit 26%
Commercial/industrial alt / per permit 26%
Unusual building type (storage/limited mini-storage)/per phase 70.00
Single-family / per permit 20.00
Consultation 489
Per Hour 54.00 61.00
Dance Permit Application Inspection 84.00 89.00 489
Development/Public Works
Entitlement Fees 247.00
Family Day Care Inspection/Pre-inspection 84.00 44.00 489
Fire Alarm System 489
Plan Check (one hour min.) 134.00 161.00
Special Fire Protection Systems: (Includes: CO2, Halon, 110.00 111.00

Clean, Agent, Dry Chemical, Activation Zone)
Devices: (Includes: Strobes, Horns, Panels, Pull Stations,

Detectors)
1- 10 devices 110.00
11 + devices there after 110.00+4.00/
per device
Fire Hydrants 432
Each 47.00
Private Hydrant Maintenance 47.00
Fire Incident Report (includes original, supplements, exposures, 401
spill/leak reports, and hard copy narratives) 0.30
Hard copy narrative (when purchased separately) 2.00
Response to inquiries requiring computer data base extraction 3.00

(computer printout) - per page

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 25



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Fire Inspections 489
Initial Inspection - (Occupancy type: F, M, B) Factory/Industrial,

Retail, Business/Office less than 50 people:

1-2,000 sq. ft. 39.00 44.00
2,001 - 5,000 sq. ft. 53.00 51.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. 58.00 59.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 6400 68.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 706:00 78.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. #1700 90.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 85.00 104.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 94.00 120.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 103.00 138.00
oo Dol s e Delete
Initial Inspection - (Occupancy type: A, E, H, S) (Excludes R-1 489

apartments, hotels/motels), Assembly (Theater, Churches
Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school), Excessive
Hazardous Material - Welding, Open - flame, High Hazard

Storage:
1-2,000 sq. ft. (S only) 39.00 44.00
1-5,000 sq. ft. 706-00 79.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. #1700 91.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 85.00 105.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 94.00 121.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. 10300 139.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 113.00 160.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 12400 184.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 13600 212.00
— oo Do e LEooo Delete
Initial Inspection - (Occupancy type: I)* Hospitals, nursing 489
homes with medical care, prisons, and mental facilities:
1-10,000 sq. ft. 188.00 229.00
10,001 - 25,000 sq. ft. 30100 437.00
25,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 415.00 644.00
40,001 - 75,000 sq. ft. 536.00 852.00
75,001 + sq. ft. 644.00 1,060.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 26



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Fire Inspections (continued) 489
1st reinspection - (Occupancy type: F, M, B) Factory/Industrial,

Retail, Business/Office less than 50 people:

Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
1-2,000 sq. ft. 6100 63.00
2,001 - 5,000 sq. ft. 7400 72.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. 81.00 82.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 89.00 92.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 98.00 103.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. 108-00 113.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 119.00 124.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 13100 134.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 14400 144.00
oo Dol s LEeon Delete
1st reinspection - (Occupancy type: A, E, H, S) (Excludes R-1 489

apartments, hotels/motels), Assembly (Theater,

Churches, Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school),
Excessive Hazardous Material - Welding, Open - flame, High
Hazard Storage:

Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
1-2,000 sq. ft. (S only) 61.00 63.00
1-5,000 sq. ft. 84.00 96.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. 92.00 106.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 10100 113.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 11100 127.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. 12200 137.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 134.00 148.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 14700 158.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 162.00 169.00
— oo Do e e Delete
1st reinspection: - (Occupancy type: I)* Hospitals, nursing homes 489
with medical care, prisons, and mental facilities:
Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
1-10,000 sq. ft. 202.00 260.00
10,001 - 25,000 sq. ft. 316.-00 468.00
25,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 429.00 675.00
40,001 - 75,000 sq. ft. 513.00 883.00
75,001 + sq. ft. 658-00 1,091.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 27



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Fire Inspections (continued) 489
2nd and subsequent reinspection/each per year - (Occupancy type:

F, M, B) Factory/Industrial, Retail, Business/Office less than 50

people:
Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
1-2,000 sq. ft. #6-00 72.00
2,001 - 5,000 sq. ft. 89.00 82.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. 98.00 92.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 10800 103.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 11900 113.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. 13100 124.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 14400 134.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 158.60 144.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 17400 155.00

oo Dol s e Delete

2nd and subsequent reinspection/each per year - (Occupancy type: 489

A, E, H, S) (Excludes R-1 apartments, hotels/motels, Assembly
(Theater, Churches, Auditorium, Restaurant), Education (any school),
Excessive Hazardous Material - Welding, Open - flame, High Hazard

Storage:
Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
1-2,000 (S only) 76-00 72.00
1-5,000 sq. ft. 9400 106.00
5,001 - 10,000 sq. ft. 163.60 117.00
10,001 - 20,000 sq. ft. 11300 127.00
20,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 12400 137.00
40,001 - 80,000 sq. ft. 136.00 148.00
80,001 - 120,000 sq. ft. 150.60 158.00
120,001 - 150,000 sq. ft. 165.60 172.00
150,001 - 200,000 sq. ft. 18200 186.00

— oo Do e —oooo Delete

2nd and subsequent reinspection/each per year - (Occupancy type: 489

[)* Hospitals, nursing homes with medical care, prisons, and
mental facilities:

Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:

1-10,000 sq. ft. 216.00 270.00
10,001 - 25,000 sq. ft. 323.00 475.00
25,001 - 40,000 sq. ft. 436.-00 682.00
40,001 - 75,000 sq. ft. 5506.00 890.00
75,001 + sq. ft 659.00 1,097.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 28



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Fire Inspections (continued) 489
Initial inspection /each per year - Occupancy type R-1

(Apartments, hotels/motels)

Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:

3 - 9 Units 54.00 56.00
10-19 Units 69:00 64.00
20 - 29 Units 84.00 74.00
30 - 49 Units 114.00 85.00
50 - 99 Units 144.00 98.00
100+ Units 456.00 113.00

1st Re- inspection /each per year - Occupancy type R-1
(Apartments, hotels/motels)

Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
3 - 9 Units 72.00 73.00
10-19 Units 87-00 84.00
20 - 29 Units 102.00 94.00
30 - 49 Units 13200 104.00
50 - 99 Units 16300 115.00
100+ Units 17800 125.00
2nd and Subsequent inspections /each per year - Occupancy type 489
R-1 (Apartments, hotels/motels)
Reinspection violations all eleared corrected: -0- -0-
Reinspection violations not eleared corrected:
3 - 9 Units 87-00 84.00
10-19 Units 102.00 94.00
20 - 29 Units 117,00 104.00
30 - 49 Units 14800 115.00
50 - 99 Units 17800 125.00
100+ Units 20000 136.00
Additional Citation Fees, if non-compliance 432
30 Days 200.00
60 Days 500.00
90 Days 800.00
High-rise inspections/per structure 2:425:00 2,432.00 489
Abatement by litigation/per occurrence (to recover litigation 1,640.00

costs for abatement actions resulting from a failure to comply
with fire inspection notices)

Fire Investigation Report 303-:60 312.00 489

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 29



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Current Proposed Amnd

Fee Description & Unit/Time
- =

— e

Fire Pumps

Pump acceptance test/each (all types)
Electrical inspectors fee/each

Fire Sprinkler Systems
Additional sprinkler head / each
Plan Check per hour (one hour min.)
1-20 Sprinkler heads
20 + Sprinkler heads

Pre-Action, Dry, Deluge, or Foam Systems
Each Floor above 3 stories
Monitoring System

Pump Acceptance Test

Fireworks:
One-time event / each
Sale of Safe and Sane Fireworks (from 06/28 to 07/06 of the
year the permit is issued) / per firework stand
Incorrect address/location given by applicant, failure of
responisble party to appear at pre-scheduled appt/per trip
Citation for non-compliance with FMC 10-53302/use of illegal
fireworks + $250.00 State Marshal Disposal Fee (TOTAL
Citation Fee will be $1,250.00)

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM

1500

209:00
400

+1.25
110:00

138:00
674100

74.00

1,000.00

400
85-00
93-00
102:00

401
Delete

489
243.00
89.00

489

161.00
111.00
111.00

1.25/spk.
124.00
124.00
124.00

243.00

489
152.00
626.00

81.00

See
Revise
Schedule
Below
Under
Special
Hazard
User
Permit
Fees

moved to Special
Hazard Area

Page 30



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Cestistne s Sl A04
—hoasoseeensaneLon s clenion e Delete

Overtime Fire Inspection / per hour (min. one hour) 14160 155.00 489

Plan Check
(Sprinkler Systems, Fire Alarms, Underground piping, 134.00
Extinguishing Systems) / per hour (Jone hour min.)

Penalty 489
Incorrect address/location given by applicant, failure of 74.00 81.00
responsible party to appear at prescheduled appt / per trip
Premature inspection call (work not ready) / per trip #4600 81.00
Reinspection other than entitled calls / per trip #4060 81.00
Working without required permit 4 x standard permit

Posting Placarding On Dangerous Buildings 14260 138.00 489

Public Safety Alarms -- Response to False Alarm 489
One response each fiscal year -0-

Second response or more each fiscal year / each 14800 165.00

Special Hazard User Permit Fees 489

—loresetrednsis SeLo

—leene e nioalane todl S

— oo il nad st e SeLo

——orsroesndgoens

S 204 o 000 e[ Lo
ceDbl 000 cn e
S EODL L0000 cn [ LELo
S 00Ol B 000 cu [ £o00
S ELOL e I 10000
—Cryegens
SEo0 oL Lo
S ECL 000 ol 7700
» 1;001-2,000-gak LELo
» 2;,001-4000-gak £o00
* 4,001+-gal 102.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 31



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Current Proposed Amnd

Fee Description & Unit/Time

—=slecies

Level 1
10-100 gallons of flammable/combustible liquid
20-100 lbs of solid
201-3,000 cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 500-999 Ibs
High Pile Storage (501-2,500 sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

Level 2
101-1,000 gallons of flammable/combustible liquid
101-1,000 Ibs of solid
3,000-6,000 cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 1,000-2,400 lbs
High Pile Storage (2,501-12,000 sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

Level 3
1,001or more gallons flammable/combustible liquid
1,0001 Ibs or more of solid
6,0001 or more cubic feet of compressed gas
Aerosols (Level 2 or 3) 2,500 or more Ibs
High Pile Storage (12,001 or more sq ft)
Hazardous Materials not otherwise specified, per
Appendex, Chapter 1, Table 105.6.20 of the
California Fire Code (CFC)

Hazardous Material Incident:
Per Apparatus/Per Hour

New

New

New

Plus other costs of supplies, materials, contract labor, etc.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM

57.00
74.00
92.00
489
238.00
Page 32



CITY FO FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Emergency Response Business Plan / per building (written
douments) 163.00 180.00 489
Open Burning / event 21160  238.00 489
Suppression Standby 21100 238.00 489
Underground Fire Service

Plan Check per hour (one hour min.) 134.00

1'- 100 110.00

101" + 110.00 +

$.80/foot

Hydrants / each 47.00

Urban Growth Management (UGM) Fire Station Capital Fees See Development

Department-UGM Fees

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:07 PM Page 33



CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time

Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports* (at all City owned facilities

Current Proposed

Amnd

that comprise the Fresno Convention & Entertainment Center, the

Riverside Municipal and Airways Golf Courses. The Arts, Park,

Entertainment and Sports (APES) ticket surcharge fee is to be

applied to all tickets sold for attendance to all event types and on

each round of golf, irrespective of the ticket selling party,

irrespective of ticket price. The City reserves the right to waive the

surcharge upon City Manager approval).
Per ticket (or attendee) and on each round of golf

0.75

Chukchansi Stadium
Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports Fee Stadium

(This fee is applicable to Chukchansi Park only. Ticket surcharge fee
is to be applied to all tickets sold for attendance to all event types)

12/01/08 to 11/30/2013
12/01/2013 to 11/30/2031

Concert Fees
Stadium Rental
Field Usage Fee
Rental Deposit
(Applied toward rental or cancellation fee.)
Stage Rental
Event Services
Box Office (per day)
Post Event Cleaning Deposit
(Up to 70% refundable based upon condition of the facility
after completion of the rental agreement.)
Reservation Cancellation Fee
30 days or more before event
Less than 30 days before event

Multi-Concert Fees
Stadium Rental
Field Usage Fee
Rental Deposit
(Applied toward rental or cancellation fee.)
Stage Rental
Event Services
Box Office
Post Event Cleaning Deposit
(Up to 70% refundable based upon condition of the facility
after completion of the rental agreement.)
Reservation Cancellation Fee
30 days or more before event
Less than 30 days before event

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM

1.00
1.50

4,000
1,500
2,000

1,200
300
350

2,500

1,000
50% of stadium
rental fee

2,500
1,500
1,500

600
300
350
2,500

750
50% of stadium

1.00

489

476
effective
12/01/08

488

488

Page 34



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Budget 393
Annual Budget, City of Fresno 43.00
Capital Improvement Plan, City of Fresno 43.00
Budget Management Guide 120.00
Budget in Brief, City of Fresno 7.00
Building, Plumbing, Electrical, and Mechanical Regulations Text 489
Chapter 13 of the FMC Booklet
Picked up 10:00 .05/per page
Mailed 17.00 .05/per page
+actual cost
of postage

Candidate Filing Fee
Councilmember*

Filing for Candidacy 300.00
Mayor*
Filing for Candidacy 500.00

* Proportionate share of Council election costs, not to exceed scheduled amounts or timely
submission of petitions with requisite number of signatures of qualified voters.

Charter, City of Fresno 489
Picked up 10:00 .05/per page
Mailed 45.00 .05/per page
+actual cost
of postage
Checks Returned Unpaid
Returned check 25.00
Check Stop Payment Fee
Per check 10.00
City Hall Rental (hourly rates)
Meeting Room A 35.00
Meeting Room B 30.00
Meeting Room C 35.00
Meeting Room D 30.00
Council Chamber 75.00
First Floor Lobby 50.00
Second Floor Lobby 50.00
Third Floor Lobby 40.00
Front Plaza (Without Restrooms) 35.00
Front Plaza (With First Floor Restrooms) 50.00
Fountain 20.00
Processing Fee - Non Refundable 30.00 480
per event

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 35



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
City Hall Rental - Additional Services (hourly rates) 480
Custodian 15.50
Electrician 69.00
Building Maintenance 57.00
Property Maintenance Worker 58.00
Security Guard 18.50
Public Announcement (PA) System, Portable
Hourly 75.00
Saturday (hourly) 112.50
Sundays or Holidays (hourly) 150.00
Multimedia - Presentation System
Hourly 72.00
Saturday (hourly) 108.00
Sundays or Holidays (hourly) 144.00

City Council Material
Agenda, mailed

Quarter 20.00
Year 70.00
—leondoldslelos e Delete
Paclket e Delete
Crtes e Delete
Minutes, mailed
Year 85.00
Comprehensive Annual Financial Report (CAFR) 14.00
Consolidated Annual Performance and Evaluation
Report (CAPER) 34.00
Consolidated Plan 34.00
Dog License 441
License fee / per dog: ANNUAL  3-YEAR 12/06
Dog 4 months or older 39.00 117.00
Spayed or neutered dog 4.00 12.00
Owner over 62 years (with evidence of age) / per dog:
Dog 4 months or older 39.00 117.00
Spayed or neutered dog 4.00 12.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 36



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Dog License - continued
Animal Control/Quarantine/Impound Fee 50.00 + Daily 441
Board Fee 12/06
Animal Control Officers Services
per hour plus currently published IRS standard milage rate 28.50
Administrative Hearing Fee 50.00
Concurrent license -0-
Final Inspection Fee 20.00 12/06
Lost/stolen tag / each 0.50
Other government / per dog 0.50
Penalty, failure to secure license / per dog 10.00
Seeing Eye dog -0-
Draw-Down Account Administrative Fee See Development Fees
Fingerprinting (DOJ Live Scan) Fee
Referral rolling fee 20.00 464
DOJ Report Fee Established by DOJ 7/1/08
Non-Profit referral -0-
Fresno Municipal Code 489
Complete Set (without binders)
Picked up 165.00 .05/per page
Mailed 185.00 .05/per page
—Mainteranee +actual cost
Yeaf 52.00 of postage
Impounded Animal Redemption
Dogs:
1st time impounded within 6 months:
Redemption fee / per dog 7.50
Maintenance charge / dog per day or fraction 2.50
2nd time impounded within 6 months:
Redemption fee / per dog 10.00
Maintenance charge / dog per day or fraction 2.50
Impounded more than twice in 6 months:
Redemption fee / per dog 15.00
Maintenance charge / dog per day or fraction 2.50
Horses and Cattle:
Redemption fee / per animal 10.00
Maintenance charge / animal per day or fraction 2.50
Trailer fee / per haul 15.00
Other animals:
Redemption fee / per animal 1.75
Maintenance charge / animal per day or fraction 1.00
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 37



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Amnd
Refunds, Handling Charge
Per refund 10.00
Reproduction Fee 480
Per Page (8 1/2 x 11) 0.05

Response to Inquiries Requiring Computer Data
Base Extraction

Written letter / per page 20.00
Computer printout / per page 0.80
Computer magnetic media / Run time minute 0.90

Security Deposit
A refundable deposit is required equal to the rental rate

charged.
Standard Specifications 409
Standard specifications / per copy 25.00
Mailing (cost) 100%
State Enterprise Zone Voucher Fee 40.00 480
Subpoenaed Records (rates established by State) 489
Standard copy / per page (including scanned/digital copies) 050 0.10
Copying documents from microfilm / per page 650 0.20
Oversize documents, documents requiring special processing Actual cost
Clerical costs associated with retrieval of records and
reproduction
Hour 20.00 24.00
Quarter hour or fraction thereof 5.00 6.00
Photocopying records at witness's place of business Actual cost

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 38



CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

GENERAL GOVERNMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Subpoenaed Records (rates established by State) - continued
Postage charge Actual cost
Costs charged to the witness by a third person for the retrieval Actual cost
and return of records held by that third person
Supplemental Historic Building Survey 40.00
(Dated: September 30, 1994)
Telephone Directory, City of Fresno 6.00
Traffic Monitoring Report - "Traffic Count Book" 8.00
Transcript, Certification of
Proofread and certify copy of transcript supplied by applicant
Hour 20.00
Quarter hour or fraction thereof 5.00
Deposit in advance 100% of est. cost
Re-recording on applicant's machine
Hour or portion 6.00
Duplication or review of Council meeting tapes
Done by applicant [on applicant's tape(s)]
Each set up 7.00
Done by staff [on applicant's tape(s)]
Per Council tape 10.00
Deposit in advance 100% of est. cost
—Cslernte e oesrs e e s pnen Hen e 489
Duplication of Civil Service Board recording
Costof cassettes-and-duplicatien 28-45+ Cost Delete
of TFapes
Per tape 44.00
Plus cost of tape(s) Actual Cost
Water History Book - "Water: The Rise of Public Ownership 13.00
on the Fresno Plane" by Todd A. Shallat
VIEWFresno Online Service Charge 433
Annual per account 1,795.00
Zoning Ordinance Text
Zoning booklet
Picked up 25:00 .05/per page
Mailed 35.00 .05/per page
—Maintenanece-service +actual cost
Annual 30-00 of postage
All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS AMendment #489 March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 39



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

RIVERSIDE MUNICIPAL GOLF COURSE - GREEN FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd

Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports* (at all City owned facilities 489
that comprise the Fresno Convention & Entertainment Center, the

Riverside Municipal and Airways Golf Courses. The Arts, Park,

Entertainment and Sports (APES) ticket surcharge fee is to be

applied to all tickets sold for attendance to all event types and on

each round of golf, irrespective of the ticket selling party,

irrespective of ticket price. The City reserves the right to waive the

surcharge upon City Manager approval).

Per ticket (or attendee) and on each round of golf 0.75 1.00
Non-Resident Surcharge (applies to all patrons who do not have a 2.00 459
valid drivers license or other identification card issued by the State 1/1/2008

of California indicating that the patron is a resident of Fresno,
California. Surcharge applies to the following green fees: weekdays,
weekend/holiday, and senior and junior rates).*

Weekdays** 20.75
after 2 p.m. (PST) 15.75
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 15.75

Weekends/Holidays (as identified in FMC 2-1513)** 28.00
after 2 p.m. (PST) 16.75
after 3 p.m. (PDST) 16.75

Tournaments** 33.00

Seniors (62 and over)** 13.25

Juniors (18 and under)* 11.50

Junior Golf Team* 4.50 475

Monthly Cards (restricted to the individual named)**

Seniors (Unlimited)* 43.25
Surcharge / per round +6.00
Juniors (Unlimited )* 42.25
Surcharge / per round +4.50

* Tee times will be restricted to weekdays and after 2 p.m. (standard time) or 3 p.m. (daylight savings
time) on weekends and holidays, or based on course availability as determined by lessee.

**
3

*** 475th amendment shall become effective upon final passage. Council Meeting will be held 09/30/08
Note: All above fees have been adjusted to include the $1.00 Art, Park, Entertainment & Sports fee.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 40



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND FACILITIES

Fee Description & Unit/Time

Current Proposed Amnd

When determined appropriate by the Director, private or non-profit groups requesting to schedule a
special event at the neighborhood center, park, or playground facilities may be required to provide
security guards from a certified security agency, police officers from the Police Department or
additional recreation leaders. The number of security guards, police officers, or recreation leaders
required will be determined by the type of event and the estimated attendance. Also, the Director is
authorized to waive the user fee for Special Events which are determined to be beneficial to the City

of Fresno.

A processing fee of $25 will be assessed for failure to notify the department of a cancellation within 48

hours of the event.
elllbhellseslgeelal Hal S*
I .
ivlcloaningd iR fundabl
—Recreation-Staff-fper-hour
Otherfaciities Community & Neighborhood Centers *
—City-spoensored;-

Public Purpose, Semi-public, non-profit organizations:
Auditorium (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Gymnasium (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Meeting rooms (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Kitchen and equipment (hour or fraction)
Security/cleaning deposit (flat/80% refundable)

Private groups and organizations, social:
Auditorium (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Gymnasium (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Meeting rooms (per hour/2 hour minimum)
Kitchen and equipment (hour or fraction)
Security/cleaning deposit (flat/80% refundable)

Recreation Staff / per hour

Stage Use Set Up fee, per occurrence (if applicable)
All organizations are recommended to hire a
stagehand(s) from stagehand Union Local 158 to operate the

-0-

37.50
37.50
25.00
60.00
100.00 - 500.00

75.00
75.00
50.00
60.00
100.00 - 500.00

13.00
75.00

lighting and sound systems at this facility and will pay the Union directly

Picnic/Pavilion Area
1/2 day
Full day

EOC Neigborhood Centers
Gymnasium (per hour / 2 hour minimum)

* Gymnasium rates do not apply to EOC Neighborhood Center.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM)

25.00
50.00

New

Delete 464

Delete

464
effective
4/1/2008

489
100.00

Page 41



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

NEIGHBORHOOD CENTER, PARKS, AND PLAYGROUND FACILITIES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Dunk Tank Rental 393
City of Fresno Departments No charge
City Co-sponsored & Joint Use Agreement organizations No charge

(Need Hold Harmless Agreement)

Non-Profit Organizations (Need Hold Harmless Agreement

& Liability Insurance) - Flat / per day 100.00
Fees for Non-profit organizations headquartered in Fresno
will be waived for events held in the City of Fresno.

Refundable Deposit - Flat / per day 50.00
Private organizations (Need Hold Harmless Agreement &
Liability Insurance) - Flat / per day 100.00
Refundable Deposit - per day 50.00
Playfield
Lighted (per hour / 2 hour minimum) 1825 35.00 489

Standard Time -- after 5 pm
Daylight Savings Time -- after 8 pm

Additional light circuit by same organization at same facility

Hour/2 hour minimum 6.25
Unlighted facility (per hour / 2 hour minimum) 12.00 25.00 489
Security/Cleaning Deposit (per facility) - flat/80% refundable 100.00 - 500.00
Rock Climbing Wall
Minimum 4 hr Rental 300.00
Additional rental time/per hr 50.00
24 x 16 Video Projection System 480
Rental (4 hr minimum) 300.00
Recreation staff additional per hr 35.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 42



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
All Swim Pools 409
Monthly swim pass (30 days of admission)
Children (ages 6 to 17) 15.00
Adults (age 18 and over) 30.00
Adult, age 18 and over 2.00
Youth, age 6 to 17 045 1.00 489
Children, age 0 to 5 (accompanied by an adult) -0-

Special Pool Rentals
Private Groups (per hour, 2- hour minimum):

1 to 50 (2 lifeguards) 25.00
51 to 100 (3 lifeguards) 37.50
101 to 150 (4 lifeguards) 50.00
151 to 200 (5 lifeguards) 62.50
200 and up (6 lifeguards) 75.00

City cosponsored and non-profit groups ¥z the above rates.
A processing fee of $25 will be assessed for failure to notify
the department of a cancellation within 48 hours of the event.

Swimming Instruction 464
All Swim Pools
One session - Ages 3 and up 30.00
Two or more sessions - Ages 3 and up 20.00
Individuals meeting low-income guidelines as 15.00

established by PG&E’s FERA program

Water Exercise

Age 3 and up / per day 1.00

Instructional Classes 464
CPR 40.00 effective
First Aid 30.00 4/1/2008
CFAS (CPR & First Aid) 50.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 43



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time

Community Sports Teams
Fees are established by the Parks, Recreation and
Community Services Director and may be prorated
for a partial season and/or services provided.

Current Proposed

Amnd

Baseball / per Team/League 500.00 - 1,250.00

Indoor Soccer / per Team/League
Outdoor Soccer / per Team/League
Volleyball / per Team/League
Basketball / per Team/League

Fast Pitch Softball / per Team/League
Slow Pitch Softball / per Team/League
Co-ed Softball / per Team/League
Flag Football / per Team/League
In-line Hockey / per Team/League
Tournaments / per Team/League
Adult Sports League Late Fee

Equipment Rentals
Chairs / day
Tables / day

Regional Sports Complex Entrance Fee
Year around / per vehicle
Regional Sports Complex User Fee
Deposit (80% refundable)
1 - 3 Fields/Day
4 - 6 Fields/Day
7 - 9 Fields/Day
Field Usage -
Adult - 2 Fields/hr/4hr minimum
Youth - 2 Fields/hr/4 hr minimum
Recreation Staff/hr
Tournament Play
1 - 3 Fields/Day
4 - 6 Fields/Day
7 - 9 Fields/Day
Night Play/Field
Basin Rental / per day
Soccer Field Restoration fee (applies to paintball rental only)

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM)

380.00
585.00
200.00
435.00
460.00
350.00
350.00
405.00
250.00
125.00 - 300.00
New

0.50
2.00

3-00
£

500.00
New
New
New

15.00
10.00
13.00

100.00
175.00
250.00
25.00
150.00
50.00

50.00

5.00
Delete

500.00
750.00
1,000.00

500.00
900.00
1,300.00

456

480
480

489
409

409

473
489

464
489

Page 44



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Vendor Fees 464
Temporary Vendor Fee (Daily per site) * 75.00-150.00
Youth Sports Camps & Instructional Leagues 489
—Eoestenl astiaatenn L Coe Lo cota o S Delete
—iechezoaltball lnstnation sl Lo cnn Lo coie oo ol S Delete
—eetbal—oeen b crmnton L lnstnoona L oncnn Lons S Delete
o
Girls/Boys Sports Camp / per participant 50.00
Youth Organization Filed Reservations ** 480
1-2 Fields per month, per organization 250.00
3-4 Fileds per month, per organization 500.00
Tournament (All Star) Flat Fee Per Day 480
1-3 Fields per day 100.00
4 or more Fileds per day 150.00

* The Director is authorized to waive the user fee for Temporary Vendor if activity determined to be
beneficial to the City of Fresno.

** Organizations must have a valid non-profit ID number to qualify. The monthly fee will be reduced by 50% with
proof that the league has more than half of their children participating in a free or reduced cost lunch program.

** Mthly reservation fee not available at the Regional Sports Complex, AL Radka, and Fig Garden Baseball Park.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 45



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current
Amphitheaters and Regional Park Group Activity Areas
(Eaton Plaza, Roeding & Regional Sports
Park Group Activity Areas)
Private or non-City groups
Group size:
Up to 200 200.00
201 to 500 350.00
Over 500 500.00
Over 1000 New
Local charitable non-profit groups
Group size:
Up to 200 100.00
201 to 500 175.00
Over 500 250.00
Over 1000 New
. I ’
—Ceuo o
Up-to-200 -0
SLode oo ~
e ~
Performance Bond 175.00 - 500.00
(100% refundable upon successful completion of the rental
agreement in accordance with also agreed upon terms and
conditions)
Cleaning Deposit
(Up to 80% refundable dependent on the condition of the
facility after completion of the rental agreement)
Group size:
Up to 200 250.00
201 to 500 500.00
Over 500 1,000.00
Over 1000 New

Amnd

464

effective

4/1/2008

1,000.00 489

500.00 489
Delete
Delete
Delete

2,000.00 489

Note: Cleaning Deposit is based upon the estimated number of attendees to any reserved venue.

—gross-eventconcessionrevenues-and-a-perattendee-charge—* Additional costs incurred for City services are

the responsibility of the reservation holder. Ex. Solide Waste costs for additional trash bins.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM)

Page 46



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Regional Park Vehicle Pass 456
Annual vehicle entrance pass (good at Roeding and
Woodward Parks and Regional Sports Complex):

Year round / per motor vehicle (Resident) 30.00 464
Year round / per motor vehicle (Non-Resident) 50.00 480
Individuals meeting low-income guidelines as established by 15.00
PG&E’s FERA program ***
Roeding Park Entrance Fee** 489
Year round / per motor vehicle 3.00 5.00
Roeding Park Picnic Table Reservation Fee* 489
—loomrenme oo ol e ol Delete
—PReCreve e e Delete
—s e =cc Delete
— sl Cen e 400 =00 Delete
— el 400 e Delete
—=renlbesie Do 400 e Delete
— oot e 400 e Delete
—— oot Rt S oo Delete
— ek Lo oo Delete
B e e 400 Delete
—Redwood-Grove 1,236 oo e Delete
—osveedCrone Lo oo Delete
—ocveed T BT O 400 =00 Delete
Picnic Shelters (full day/year round/per table) New 15.00
Skate and Bike Park Facility Rental 489
Modular Park Rental/per hour (2 minimum)
Up to 50 participants allowed New 35.00
Concrete Park Rental/per hour (2 minimum)
Up to 100 participant allowed New 50.00
Option fee: Onsite Instructor/per hour
Multiple instructors available for large groups New 15.00
Security/Cleaning Deposit 9per facility)-flat/80% New  100.00
refundable

* Director is authorized to waive the user fee for special events which are determined to be beneficial
to the City of Fresno.

*% m m

** Park entrance fee shall be waived for either vehicles displaying Disabled Person Placard/Decal or
vehicles in which a senior citizen (age 62 or older) is a passenger/driver.

***Eresno Residents Only

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 47



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

GENERAL RECREATION FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Woodward Park Entrance Fee*** 489
Year round / per motor vehicle 3.00 5.00
—rlerosld oo o bis ot Eon Delete A7
Woodward Park Picnic Table Reservation Fee* 489
Year round / per table: Full-Day** e ot
Gazebo 10.00 5.00 12.00 Delete
Picnic shelters 25.00 12.50 30.00 Delete
Woodward Park Equestrian Area Entrance Fee*** 456
Year round / per Horse trailer 1.00
Woodward Park Rotary Amphitheater Improvement Fee 472
As of 8/9/08 1.00 per attendee
As of 1/1/09 2.00 per attendee
As of 1/1/10 3.00 per attendee
Urban Growth Management (UGM) Park Fees See Development Fees Department-UGM

* Director is authorized to waive the user fee for special events which are determined to be beneficial
to the City of Fresno. One security guard will be present for the duration of the event. Additional
security may be required at the discretion of the Director of Parks, Recreation and Community

Services. Fees for additional security are not included in rental fees and will be charged to all

groups at the hourly rate listed in the Master Fee Schedule.

*** Director is authorized to waive the entrance fee for special events which he determines to be
beneficial to the City of Fresno. Fees may be waived for participants only or for the duration of the
event.

*** Park entrance fee shall be waived for either vehicles displaying Disabled Person Placard/Decal or
vehicle in which a senior citizen (age 62 or older) is a passenger/driver.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM) Page 48



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PARKS, RECREATION, & COMMUNITY SERVICES DEPARTMENT

ACTION SPORTS FEES
Fee Description & Unit/Time

Instructional Camps

6 Week Program (six 1 hour sessions on 6 consecutive Saturdays)
4 Week Program (four 1 hour sessions on 4 consecutive Saturdays)

Note: Minimum 7 registered campers per camp.

Instructional Classes
BMX Lessons (six 1 hour classes)
Skateboard Lessons (six 1 hour classes
Mountain Bike Lessons (six 1 hour classes)

Note: All classes are limited to 10 participants and must
have at least five enrolled to begin the class.

FEES MAINTAINED UNDER CONTRACT AGREEMENT
Annual Membership - National Bicycle League
Local Race Fee - per rider*
Local Practice - per rider

Regional Sports complex Paintball Facility
Individual Play
Individual Player
Individual Player with rental set
Group Play (mixed play must be paid by one person at one time)
10 to 20 players
21 to 30 players
31 or more players
Private Groups
Minimum of 10 players
w/rental sets
Tournaments
Local
Affiliated
Extreme Paintaball Sports League
National Professional Paintball

BMX/Skate Contest Fees
Amateur Contest / Per Entry
Pro Contest / Per Entry

* Family Local Race Discount: First two riders pay full price and 3rd or more riders receive 50% discount.

** Supply deposits are 100% refundable

*** Fyent must be set up at least 14 days in advance by calling Maximum Paintball Supply (the store)
Event packages include: 4 hours of paintball, semi Auto Marker, Safety Mask, Full 200z tank of Co2 and unlimited

refills, 500 rounds of paintballs and your own referees.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) (3/19/201012:08 PM)

Current Proposed Amnd
486
120.00
100.00

464

40.00 effective

40.00 4/1/2008
40.00

45.00 468
12.00
6.00

474

effective

15.00 9/26/2008
25.00
14.00
13.00
12.00
15.00
25.00
200.00
650.00
950.00
2,500.00

489

New 15.00
New 30.00

Page 49



CITY OF FRESNO

MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT FEES

COVENANTS AND SPECIAL AGREEMENTS

Fee Description & Unit/Time
Private Projects (5 acres or more)
City filing fee / application + filing fees
County Clerk filing fee / application + filing fees

Fire Department Review Private Project / per application

Police Department Review/per application (exclude senior
citizen functions)

Traffic Engineering Review Private Project / per application

Tentative Parcel Map (no other entitlements)
Application + filing fees

Tentative Tract Map (no other entitlements)
City filing fee / application + filing fees
County Clerk filing fee / application + filing fees

Traffic Engineering Review Tentative Parcel and Tract Maps
Per application

Fish and Game Filing Fee (for applicable projects) *
Payable to: County of Fresno (to be remitted to the
State of California)

Environmental Charges
Non-entitlement public projects (fees based on per Project)
Exemption
County Clerk filing fee
Negative declaration
County Clerk filing fee
Mitigated negative declaration
Mitigated negative declaration with special studies
(noise, traffic water, etc.)

Environmental Impact Report (EIR)
Analysis of EIR for private projects
Minor
Request + filing fees
Major
Request + filing fees
City filing fee
County Clerk filing fee

Fish and Game Filing fee for EIRs *
Payable to: County of Fresno (to be remitted to the
State of California)

* Fee will be effecitve upon final passage.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM

Current

2050.00*
50.00

247.00
210.00

91.00SS

210.00

690.00*SS
25.50
50.00

91.00SS
1993.:00 2,010.25

640.00
50.00
2,940.00
50.00
5,460.00
5,360.00 + staff time
and direct costs

15,760.00

22,140.00
25.50
50.00

276825 2,792.25

464

409

464

489

464

464

464
489

Page 50



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT FEES

CODE ENFORCEMENT FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Amnd
Code Violation Appeal Fee 409
Single Family Residential up to two units 35.00
Multi-Residential with three or more units 55.00
Commercial Apartment Complexes and Commercial Business 75.00
Code Citation Penalties 409
1 citation for non-compliance of code violations up to or 200.00
maximum
2" citation for non-compliance of code violations up to or 500.00
maximum
3" citation for non-compliance of code violations up to or 800.00
maximum
Collection Agency Recovery Fee 25% 409
Late Payment Charge 409
$1.00 minimum 1.5%
Lien Release Fee
Per lien release - County Filing Fee 26.00 58.75 489
Hotel/Motel Inspection Fee 464
Hour, 1-hour minimum 100.00
Family day care annual inspection 100.00 464
Hour, 1 hour minimum
Housing Code 464
Inspection/lender requested
Hour, 1 hour minimum 100.00
Housing code enforcement 464
Hour, 1 hour minimum 100.00

Family day care licensing inspection

Hour, 1 hour minimum 100.00
Code compliance inspection 216.00 409
Hourly 1 hour minimum 100.00 464

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 51



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

ENTERPRISE ZONE AREAS - SPECIAL RATES

I. Business License Fees
Waived for a period of three years.

Business license fees, as contained in Section 4, "Business License and Permit Requirements," of the
Master Fee Schedule, are waived for a three-year period from the time the business locates in a
commercial area of the Enterprise Zones as identified ir Exhibit A* on the Official Enterprise Zone Map.
Such waiver will be available only to firms establishing new operations in the commercial area and will
not apply to existing businesses relocating from one address to another within the area. No waiver will
be granted to businesses created by legal reorganization or changes in ownership of existing
commercial area firms.

* Street address ranges from the areas shown on Enterprise Zone Maps the maps identified as Exhibits A
and B are available in the office of the Department of Downtown & Community Revitalization
Resources of the City of Fresno. For ease of use, an incentive zone locator is available on the city;s
website at www.fresnoez.com.

II. Permit Fees and Development Entitlement Fees
Refund of a portion of fees paid (The rebate to equal 50 percent with certain maximum reductions).

Permit and inspection fees will be refunded to the property owner 50 percent, not to exceed a maximum
refund of $300 per property, for minor additions or alterations for buildings in the commercial and
industrial areas of the Enterprise Zone, as identified i Exhibits A and B The Official Enterprise Zone
Map, respectively. Such refunds of fees will apply to items contained in Sections 7a, 7b, 7c, and 7d,
"Minor Additions and Alterations of the Master Fee Schedule for buildings which have been vacant for
12 consecutive months or more prior to submission of an application for a permit.

Determination of the building vacancy period will be the responsibility of the Development Department.
Evidence documenting the vacancy period may include a signed statement from the property owner,
utility billing or service records, or statements from individuals, other than the owner of the property,
who are familiar with the building.

Fees in Section 8, "Land Use and Zoning," and Section 9, "New Construction, Major Additions, and
Alterations," will be partially refunded to the property owner for projects in the commercial and the
industrial areas of the Enterprise Zone. The refunded amount will be 50 percent of the fees paid
pursuant to Sections 8 and 9 of this Schedule, not to exceed a maximum reduction of $500 per
property. Such refund shall be available only once for each property during the term of the Enterprise
Zone program and will not apply to later subdivisions of the property.

lll. Application and Resolution of Issuance Fees for Tax-Exempt Industrial Development Bonds
Reduction of 50 percent.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 52



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

The Tax-Exempt Bond Application Forms Fee, the Application Submission Fee, and the Official
Resolution of Issuance Fee, as contained in Section 12, "Miscellaneous” of the Master Fee Schedule,
are reduced by 50 percent for projects located in the commercial area of the Enterprise Zone, as
identified by Exhibit A the Official Enterprise Zone Map, and the industrial area of the Enterprise Zone,
as identified by Exhibit B the Official Enterprise Zone Map. Any additional costs associated with the
issuance of the bonds following the Official Resolution of Issuance, including administrative expenses
as defined by the Fresno Municipal Code, Section 18-101, shall be paid by the applicant or deducted

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted

MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 53



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

MUNICIPAL RESTORATION ZONE - SPECIAL RATES

A copy of the MRZ Policy can be obtained at the City of Fresno Downtown & Community
Revitalization Department. The MRZ Policy contains definitions for the capitalized terms in this
Municipal Restoration Zone Section.

I. Business License Fees
Refund or Payment - Maximum availability three(3) consecutive years.

Under the Fresno Municipal Code, businesses and professionals pay quarterly business license fees.
An Eligible New or Expanding business located in a commercial area of the Municipal Restoration Zone
(MRZ)*, between October 1 and June 1 following the June 30 end of each Incentive Period may apply
for a payment equal to the business license fees it actually paid during the Incentive Period in which the
business was certified under this policy. For the ensuing two Incentive Periods in which the business is
re-certified, the Eligible New or Expanding business may receive a payment based on the business
license fees paid during each of the two Incentive Periods in which re-certified provided the appropriate
certified and approved documentation is timely submitted to the Downtown & Community Revitalization
Department in form and substance acceptable to the Director of that Department. Documentation shall
include, but is not limited to the following:

(a) A copy of the invoice or billing statement.
(b) A copy of the Eligible Business’ canceled check (front and back) showing the amount and date
of payment.

Application for Refund or Payment - Qualified businesses may receive a refund or payment, by
submitting the application to the City of Fresno Downtown & Community Revitalization Department,
Attention: Incentive Zone Manager Bireeter; 2600 Fresno Street, Room 2156 Fresno, California 93721-
3608.

* Available from the City of Fresno Downtown & Community Revitalization Department are street address
ranges for commercial and other areas within the boundaries of the MRZ as these beundaries are

identified-in-Exhibits B-1-and-B-2-of the MRZ pelicy the Official MRZ Map.

Note: See “Business Tax and Permit Requirements” in the Finance Section of this Master Fee
Schedule

Please note that a moratorium on claims by businesses not qualified by December 31, 2009
is in place unitl July 1, 2012.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) 3/19/201012:08 PM Page 54



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

POLICE DEPARTMENT

GENERAL FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time
Police Reports
Accident, injury or non-injury
Report that contains 10 pages or less

Report that contains 11 pages or more

Other reports
Report that contains 10 pages or less

Report that contains 11 pages or more

Public Safety Alarms -- Response to False Alarm

One response each fiscal year

Second or more responses each fiscal year/each

Regional Training Center Facilities Fees
Range Office - monthly
Shared Range Office - monthly
Classroom - daily
Classroom - half day
Mat Room - daily
Mat Room - half day
Pistol Range - daily
Pistol Range - half day
Rifle Range - daily
Rifle Range - half day
Tactical House - daily
Tactical House - Half day
Range Fee - Daily rate per person

Emergency Vehicle Operations Course (EVOC) - daily

Dirve Awareness Pad - daily
K-9 Filed - daily

Pursuit Car - daily

PIT Car - dalily

Motorcycle - daily

Training Officer - Hourly Straight Time
Training Officer - Hourly Overtime
Training Sergeant - Hourly Straight Time
Training Sergeant - Overtime

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM]

Current Proposed

Amnd

-0-
0.20 / page

-0-
0.20 / page

-0-
155.00

New

450.00
225.00
250.00
175.00
400.00
250.00
600.00
400.00
700.00
450.00
500.00
350.00

15.00

1,300.00

400.00
200.00
88.00
75.00

47.00
53.90
56.01
63.62
67.52

401

489

Page 55



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

POLICE DEPARTMENT

GENERAL FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Police Citation New 489
1st citation per violation 1,000.00
2nd citation per violation 10,000.00
3rd citation per violation 50,000.00
Other: Actual Cost 489

a) Actual administrative costs

b) Enforcement costs

c) Abatement costs

d) Costs incurred by the City associated with
relocation of tenants resulting from enforcement of
this Ordinance (FMC 10-715)

Response to Inquiries Requiring Computer Data Base 401
Extraction
Computer printout/page 1.00
Computer magnetic media
Run time per minute 1.00
Premise history searches - Offline data
Per location per 3 month period 103.00
Premise history searches & summaries - Offline data
Per location 25.00
Research time
Per minute Actual Cost
Repossession Report Filing Fee 15.00 456
Securing Occupied Private Residence or Business
Vendor costs to secure premises / per Residence or Actual cost
Business

Street Signs
Neighborhood Watch Sign / each 30.00
Patrol Sign / each 25.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM] Page 56



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SHEDULE

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

SOLID WASTE RATES**

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Roll-off and Compactor Service (Single & Mutli-Family 489
Residential)

Recycling Tipping fee / per ton 1746 17.15

Green Waste Tipping fee / per ton 2270 23.15

Landfill Tipping fee / per ton 21.95

Transfer Station Tip Fee / per ton 2812 28.70

Per haul - Landfill 168.00

Per haul - Transfer Station 107.00
SOLID WASTE, NON-BIN/COLLECTION SERVICES* 483
Single-family Residential effective

Basic service / per month 9/1/2009
One 96-gallon container one day per week 25.37

Additional automated containers (12-month minimum) after
first 96-gallon container:

64-gallon container / per month 7.43
96-gallon container / per month 10.25
96-gallon green waste container / per month 3.87
96-gallon recycling container / per month 3.74
Alternative service / per month
One 64-gallon container one day per week 19.20
Senior Citizen (62 years or older) meeting all the conditions listed 483
below / per month: effective
1 Service must be in name of senior citizen; 9/1/2009

2 Occupants of residence must be senior citizen or
dependants of senior citizen;
3 Benefitting senior citizen must meet California Public
Utilities Commission poverty level guidelines;
4  Benefitting senior citizen must notify the City when they no
longer qualify.
Basic service / per month

One 96-gallon container one day per week 21.81
One 64-gallon container one day per week 16.51
Container Exchange 36.18 464

* Fee changes effective 09/01/09
** Rates shall be adjusted annually by staff during the budget process to reflect the rates in effect as
per Reso. No. 2007-79

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM] Page 57



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SHEDULE

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

WASTEWATER RATES**

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Hauled Waste Disposal 464
Pumper truck In-lieu
1,000 gallons® 69.812 06/05
Capital 13.496
O&M 56.316
Fats, Oil & Grease - per gallon New 0.03 489
Hauled Waste disposal station keys: 464
Replacement / per key 25.00
Pretreatment Surcharges (monthly charges)
Category | - Individual permit* 27.54
Category Il - General permit** 4.05
Category Il - No permit required*** 1.29
Category IV - All residential users 0.06

* All industrial high-strength and categorically regulated users.

** All commercial establishments which may require pretreatment and monitoring activity (automotive
repair, bakeries--retail, car washes, hotels/motels with dining facilities, laundromats, markets with
garbage disposals, mortuaries, nursing homes, printers, restaurants, shopping centers).

***No discharge of process water (automotive--retail, business/services).

Special Charges and Penalties 435
Disconnection or reconnection inspection fee / per inspection 12.50
Discharge flow dye test / per test 43.75
Pretreatment Administrative Penalties 464
Notice of Non-compliance 250.00 480
Warning Notice 250.00
Notice of Violation 500.00
Consent Order 750.00
Compliance Order 1,000.00
Show Cause Order 1,000.00
Administrative cost recovery charges for failure to meet 464
reporting deadlines:
First day late (after 5 business days grace period) / per day 45.00
Each additional day late 22.50
General inorganic and bacteriological analysis/per hour 50.00
Composite Sampler Rental / per day 75.00
Pretreatment enforcement charges/per hour 45.00
Miscellaneous non-enforcement charges/per hour 45.00

! There are 748 gallons in a hundred cubic feet.

2 Rates per 1,000 gallons are approximate as they have been rounded to the 3rd decimal place.

** Rates shall be adjusted annually by staff during the budget process to reflect the rates in effect as per
Res. No. 2007-79

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM] Page 58



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SHEDULE

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

WATER CONNECTION CHARGES (FMC 14-107)

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Sale of Surplus Dirt 456
City load / per yard of dirt 5.00
Customer pick-up / per yard of dirt 1.20
Deferment of Payment applicable to existing See FMC Sctn 9-503.1

single-family residences
Same basis and fees as sewer connection charges.

Frontage Charge
Front foot or fraction 6.50

Installation Charges
Meter & Service Installation (when installed together)

1-inch 2,241.00
1-1/2-inch 2,508.00
2-inch 2,671.00
Minimum residential service connections: 489
Lots less than 12,506 20,000 square feet (1-inch) Text Change
Lots 42,500 20,000 square feet or greater (1-1/2-inch) Text Change
Meter Installation (when installed on existing services) 415
1-inch 330.00
1-1/2-inch 455.00
2-inch 530.00
Larger than 2-inch (FMC 14-111)
Cost plus overhead 100%
Service Installation (without meter) 464

Service to house (between property line and house) can be
reduced based upon setback, fixtures, etc., as provided in
the UPC and UBC. (includes tap, service line, corp stop,
curb stop and fittings)

1-inch 2,178.00
1-1/2-inch 2,363.00
2-inch 2,486.00
Larger than 2-inch (FMC 14-111)

Cost plus overhead 100%

Recharge Area Fee
Area (per unit**) 160.00 438

T *No. 101 -0-
t T *No. 101 -0-
No. 201 -0-
No. 301 -0-
No. 401 -0-
***N o, 501 56.00

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM] Page 59



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SHEDULE

PUBLIC UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

WASTEWATER RATES**

Fee Description & Unit/Time * Current Proposed Amnd
High Industrial (continued) Amend
Sewage effluent, metered Effective
Per HCF* 0.542 9/1/2009
Capital 0.174
O&M 0.368
=+ BOD / pound 0.253
Capital 0.081
Oo&M 0.172
=+ TSS/ pound 0.287
Capital 0.092
0o&M 0.195
or
Per 1,000 gallons® 0.726
Capital 0.233
o&M 0.493
=+ BOD / pound 0.253
Capital 0.081
Oo&M 0.172
=+ TSS/ pound 0.287
Capital 0.092
0o&M 0.195

Pounds of BOD or TSS can be calculated using the following formulas:

Pounds BOD = (W + 1,000,000) * 8.345 * BOD concentration in mg/I

Pounds TSS = (W =+ 1,000,000) * 8.345 * TSS concentration in mg/I

Note: BOD concentration can be based on the actual or estimated value Text
W=sewer or water flow in gallons/day

Low Industrial:
Potable water, metered

HCF* 1.045
Capital 0.336
O&M 0.709

1,000 Gallons*® 1.397
Capital 0.449
O&M 0.948

Sewage effluent, metered

HCF* 1.149
Capital 0.369
O&M 0.780

1,000 Gallons*® 1.535
Capital 0.493
Oo&M 1.042

! There are 748 gallons in a hundred cubic feet.

2 Rates per 1,000 gallons are approximate as they have been rounded to the 3rd decimal place.

* Rates are effective 9/1/09

** Rates shall be adjusted annually by staff during the budget process to reflect the rates in effect as per
Reso. No. 2007-79

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM] Page 60



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

ENGINEERING, INSPECTION, AND STREET WORK

Fee Description & Unit/Time

Television Inspection/Sewer
Viewing, Color
Per linear foot
Standby, Color
15-minute period or fraction
Pereall

Urban Growth Management (UGM) Fees

Vacation -- Public street, alley, easement, and other public
rights-of-way
Application/feasibility study / per application
Processing and legal noticing / per application
Agreement / each

Fire Department surcharge / per application

Verification of facilities, existing zoning, flood prone areas, and
similar development and record inquiries re-submission / per
response

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM

Current Proposed Amnd

0.85
35.00

14000 Delete

See Development
Department-UGM Fees

456
450.00
1,555.00
310.00
23.00
205.00
Page 61



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

PARKING FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Proposed Amnd
Parking, City of Fresno Employees

All lots / per month 15.00

Replacement permit / per replacement 10.00
—=coonc ot lemnloveowiincocondvelhiclo lone e fe o 2500 Delete
—odldnsonithout oot in soctad arenc foor oy £ Delete

Official vehicle permit / per month 20.00

Parking, DMV Hold Administrative Fee
Per violation 5.00

Parking Late Payment Penalties

Overtime Parking Penalty / per violation 2 times penalty
Restricted Zone Penalty / per violation 2 times penalty
Parking Permits* 489

Mall Specific and Non-Mall Specific Areas, Permits Parking
Rates in Garages and Lots

Permit Hours based on Option Selected and Fees Paid.
All Permits will be assigned a specific Garage or Lot, dependent
on location selected and Plan.
6 am to 6pm, Mon-Fri
Uncovered spaces per month 65.00 70.00
Covered spaces per month 80.00 85.00

Annual Purchase
Each option listed above can be reduced by purchasing
these permits at the annual rate, with annual prepayment
required. Purchase is equal to payment for 10 months
parking, with 12 month received.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM Page 62



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

PARKING FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Amnd

Parking Permits* - continued
Bulk Rate
Additional discounts can be obtained as follows:
20 to 49 annual permits, add an additional 10%
off the annual rate.
50 to 99 annual permits, add an additional 15%
off the annual rate.
Over 100 annual permits, add an additional 20% off
the annual rate.

Failure to pay overtime parking fee within 15 days

Per incident 5.00
Failure to purchase repeat monthly parking permit within first 5 10.00
working days of month / per incident
Parking without a permit in posted areas / per day 9.00 480
Replacement Permit / per incident 10.00
Mall Specific and Non-Mall Specific Areas, Short term Daily Rates in Garages and Lots
First hour 0-60 minutes 3.00 464
Each additional hour
0-60 minutes 1.00
Maximum per day 9.00
Loss of Parking Ticket / per incident 9.00

Validation Tickets

Bulk purchase only by business owners with valid business
license issued by the City of Fresno Registered Businesses
w/Business Tax ID, or Governmental Agencies

First hour/per ticket 1.50 480
Any other hour/per ticket 0.50
per ticket
Event Parking 489
Weekday 1/2 day event parking voucher New 3.00
0-4 hours, 100 minimum 600 maximum
Weekday full day event parking voucher New 5.00
4 - 8 hours, minimum 100 maximum 600
Special Event Rate* New 7.00

* Excludes Grizzlies Games

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM Page 63



CITY OF FRESNO
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

PARKING FEES

Fee Description & Unit/Time Current Amnd

Parking Penalties - Disabled or Handicapped* 464
Parking in handicapped crosshatch zone / per violation 300.00
Parking in handicapped zone / per violation 300.00
Parking in spaces for the disabled (CVC 22507.8) / per violation 300.00

Parking, Restricted Zone Penalties* ** 482
Parked on Public Grounds 40.00
Parked in a Bike Lane 40.00
Parked with Intersection 40.00
Parked in Crosswalk 40.00
Parked in Driveway 40.00
Parked on Sidewalk 40.00
Obstruction of Roadway 40.00
Parked Double 40.00
Not Parked within 18 Inch of Curb 40.00
Parked on Street Wrong Direction 40.00
Parked in the Roadway 40.00
Parked making Traffic Hazard 40.00
Vehicle Parked unattended Motor Running 40.00
Obstructing Traffic Flow 40.00
Parked immobilized vehicle 40.00
Parked in Alley 40.00
Parked in Alley not Rt Side 40.00
Block Alley Leaving < 10 ft 40.00
Parked on City Owned Lot/No Permit 40.00
Parked in Bicycle Path 40.00
Parked in Bicycle Zone 40.00
No park within 18 inch to curb 40.00
Parallel Parked Divided Hwy 40.00
Parallel Parking < 18 in to curb 40.00
Not Parked within Marked Space 40.00
No Parking at Painted Curb 40.00
Parked at Postal Mailing Curb 40.00

* That fees shall become effective upon final passage.

** Includes the following mandated items: $3.00 County Court Construction, $1.50 County Jail Construction, and
$3.00 Immediate and Critical Needs Construction Fund, and $2.00 State General Fund.

All fees effective 07/01/10 unless otherwise noted
MFS Amendment #489 (March 2010) [3/19/201012:09 PM Page 64



	MFS_Summaries_All Depts
	MFS_AIRPORTS
	MFS_FIRE
	MFS_GENERAL GOVT
	MFS_PARKS
	MFS_PLANNING
	MFS_POLICE
	MFS_PUBLIC UTILITIES
	MFS_PUBLIC WORKS



